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Abstract - Selecting projects can be a complex task due to 

the multiple dimensions involved in measuring their impact, 

especially when there are multiple decision-makers. This paper 

focuses on a real application of project selection for academic 

projects, utilizing the opinions of experts through a group 

decision-making model known as the Topic Selection method. 

Four types of criteria, including qualitative, quantitative, 

negative, and positive criteria, are considered for selecting the 

best project among five options and ranking them accordingly. 

 Additionally, the study utilizes the data from the last 

five-to-six years to check if any group has already taken up the 

topic. To achieve this, Support Vector Machine (SVM) Data 

Mining algorithms are employed. SVMs are chosen for their 

ability to handle both linear and non-linear data efficiently, 

making them suitable for this task. By combining the expertise 

of experts and the power of SVMs, this study aims to provide a 

robust methodology for project selection in academic settings, 

considering various dimensions of impact and availability of 

topics. 

 In conclusion, the project selection process for 

academic projects requires careful consideration of multiple 

criteria and the use of advanced techniques such as SVMs for 

data analysis. By incorporating expert opinions and historical 

data, the Topic Selection method offers a comprehensive 

approach to selecting and ranking projects, ensuring that the 

chosen projects are both impactful and unique within the 

academic context. 
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1. INTRODUCTION  
A project is a temporary endeavor undertaken to 

create a unique product, service, or result. This temporary 
nature means that every project has a definite end. The 
project's end is reached when its objectives have been 
achieved, or it becomes evident that the objectives will not 
or cannot be met, or when the need for the project no longer 
exists and it is terminated. While "temporary" does not 
necessarily imply short in duration, many projects can last 
for several years. Regardless, the duration of a project is 
finite, and projects are not ongoing efforts. 

 The selection of a project from a set of 
possible alternatives is a challenging task that decision-
makers (DMs) must face. Project selection and evaluation 

involve decisions crucial to the profitability, growth, and 
survival of project management organizations, particularly 
in today's increasingly competitive global scenario. These 
decisions are complex, as they require the identification, 
consideration, and analysis of numerous tangible and 
intangible factors. Factors such as market demand, 
technological feasibility, financial viability, resource 
availability, and strategic alignment all play a role in project 
selection and evaluation. 

To effectively select and evaluate projects, DMs 
must employ a systematic approach that considers all 
relevant factors. This approach often involves the use of 
decision-making models and techniques that help in 
evaluating the potential risks, benefits, and outcomes 
associated with each project alternative. By utilizing such 
models and techniques, DMs can make informed decisions 
that maximize the likelihood of selecting projects that align 
with organizational goals and objectives. 

In conclusion, project selection and evaluation are 
critical processes that require careful consideration of 
various factors. The temporary nature of projects, coupled 
with the need to select projects that contribute to 
organizational success, underscores the importance of 
effective project management practices. By employing 
systematic approaches and leveraging decision-making 
models, organizations can enhance their project selection 
and evaluation processes, ultimately improving their 
overall project management effectiveness. 
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 The paper "Best Project Selection by Using of Group TOPSIS 

Method" by Javad Dodangeh, Majid Mojahed, and Rosnah bt 

Mohd Yusuff, published in the 2009 International Association 

of Computer Science and Information Technology - Spring 

Conference, presents an innovative approach to project 
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selection in the telecommunications sector. The authors tackle 

the complex task of project selection, which is challenging due 

to multiple dimensions of impact and the involvement of 

multiple decision-makers. The paper introduces the TOPSIS 

(Technique for Order Preference by Similarity to Ideal 

Solution) method as a group decision-making model for project 

selection. This method incorporates the opinions of experts and 

considers four types of criteria—qualitative, quantitative, 

negative, and positive—to evaluate and rank five 

telecommunication projects. The involvement of three experts 

specializing in cable network projects adds a valuable 

dimension to the decision-making process, ensuring that 

technical expertise is considered alongside other criteria. 

Through a detailed case study in the 

telecommunication sector, the authors demonstrate the 

application of the TOPSIS method in real-world project 

selection. The results of the study are analyzed 

comprehensively, highlighting the effectiveness of the TOPSIS 

method in selecting the best project among multiple 

alternatives. This paper not only contributes to the field of 

project selection but also demonstrates the practical application 

of group decision-making models in complex decision 

environments. 

 

3. MODULE DESCRIPTION 

 

 

 
 

Fig 3.1 System Architecture 

 

Unique Project Selection Method for Institutes offers 

a structured and data-driven approach to address the limitations 

of existing systems. It introduces a comprehensive multi-

criteria decision-making model that considers factors such as 

project feasibility, strategic alignment, resource availability, 

and potential impact. Expert input from relevant fields is also 

incorporated to ensure technical soundness and success 

likelihood. Data analytics techniques, including SVM 

algorithms, are used to analyze historical data, ensuring 

selected projects are unique and not repetitive. A project 

lifecycle management framework is implemented to monitor 

and control projects, ensuring timely and within-budget 

completion. Continuous improvement is emphasized through 

regular review and evaluation of the selection process, ensuring 

its effectiveness and relevance over time. This proposed system 

aims to enhance efficiency, transparency, and effectiveness in 

project selection processes for institutes. 

Furthermore, the proposed system facilitates a more 

transparent and accountable decision-making process. By 

incorporating a structured approach that considers multiple 

criteria and expert input, the rationale behind project selection 

decisions becomes clearer. This transparency helps build trust 

among stakeholders, as they can better understand why certain 

projects are chosen over others. Additionally, the system's 

emphasis on data analytics ensures that decisions are based on 

objective analysis rather than subjective judgment, further 

enhancing accountability. 

Moreover, the proposed system enables institutes to 

adapt to changing external conditions and evolving project 

requirements. By regularly reviewing and evaluating the 

project selection process, institutes can identify areas for 

improvement and implement necessary changes. This adaptive 

approach ensures that the project selection method remains 

effective and relevant in the face of new challenges and 

opportunities. Overall, the proposed system offers institutes a 

comprehensive and adaptive approach to project selection, 

enhancing their ability to choose projects that align with their 

goals and maximize their impact. 
 

 

 

3. MODULE 

 
Data Analytics Module: 

The Data Analytics module plays a crucial role in the Unique 

Project Selection Method for Institutes by implementing 

advanced analytical techniques, such as Support Vector 

Machine (SVM) algorithms. This module is responsible for 

analyzing historical project data to identify trends, patterns, and 

potential overlaps with past projects. 

 

Data Preprocessing: 

Before analysis, the module preprocesses the data to ensure its 

quality and relevance. This may include cleaning the data, 

handling missing values, and transforming the data into a 

suitable format for analysis. 

 

Feature Selection: The module selects relevant features 

(criteria) from the dataset that are important for the project 

selection process. This helps in reducing the dimensionality of 

the data and improving the efficiency of the analysis 

 

SVM Algorithm Implementation: SVM algorithms are used 

to analyze the data and classify projects based on their 

characteristics. SVMs are particularly effective for binary 

classification tasks, such as selecting the best project among 

several alternatives. 

 

Data Visualization: The module provides tools for visualizing 

the analyzed data, making it easier for stakeholders to 

understand and interpret the results. This may include charts, 

graphs, and other visualizations that highlight key findings. 

 

Result Interpretation: The module interprets the results of the 

data analysis, providing insights into the strengths and 

weaknesses of each project. This information is used in the 

decision-making process to select the best project 

-  
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4. GUI/WORKING MODULES 

 

Fig4.1 : 1 

 

Fig4.1 : 2 

 

Fig4.1 :3 

 

Fig4.1 : 4 

5.  CONCLUSIONS 
The unique project selection method for an institute stands out 

as a significant advancement in project management practices. 

By integrating expert opinions, qualitative and quantitative 

criteria, and data mining algorithms, this method offers a 

systematic and comprehensive approach to project selection. It 

addresses the complexities of decision-making by considering 

multiple dimensions and involving multiple decision-makers. 

The method's inclusion of both positive and negative criteria 

ensures a balanced evaluation, leading to the selection of 

projects that align most closely with the institute's strategic 

objectives. 

 Moreover, the method's reliance on the Group 

TOPSIS technique highlights its commitment to incorporating 

diverse perspectives and expertise. This not only enhances the 

quality of project selection but also fosters a culture of 

collaboration and knowledge sharing within the institute. 

Additionally, the method's use of SVM Data Mining algorithms 

to analyze historical data adds a layer of sophistication, 

enabling more informed and data-driven decision-making. By 

leveraging these advanced techniques, the institute can make 

more strategic and impactful project selections, ultimately 

enhancing its overall performance and competitiveness.  

   

 

6. REFERENCES 

[1] PMBOK Guide, A guide to the project management body 

of know, Third Edition, 2004, p. (5, 7) 

[2] C.L.Hwang & K.P.Yoon , “ Multiple Attribute Decision 

Making and Introduction “ , London , Sage Publication , 

1995,PP2. 

[3] Ghodsypour.H,”Multiple Objective Decision Making”, 

Amir Kabir University Publication, 2003. 

[4] R. P. Mohanty, project selection by a multi-criteria 

decision making method: an example from a developing 

country, International Journal of Project Management, 10, 

(1992), 31-38. 

[5] S. Mahmoodzadeh, J. Shahrabi, M. Pariazar and M. S. 

Zaeri, project selection by using fuzzy AHP and TOPSIS 

technique, International Journal of Human and Social 

Sciences, 1, (2007). 

[6] Eddie W. L. Cheng, Heng Li, exploring quantitative 

methods for project location selection, Building and 

Environment, 39, (2004), 1467-76. 

[7] R. P. Mohanty, R. Agarval, A. K. Choudhury and M. K. 

Tiwari, International Journal of Production Research, 

International Journal of Production Research, 43(23), 

(2005), 5199-5216. 

[8] S. Ghornani, M. Rabbani, a new multi objective algorithm 

for a project selection problem, Advance in Engineering 

Software, accepted 14 march 2008-12-05. 

[9] Ringuest JL. , Graves SB., the linear multi objective R&D 

project selection problem, Eng Manage, IEEE Trans, 

(1989), 36-54. 

http://www.ijsrem.com/

